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If you fall into the flood 
water, move parallel to the 

water flow without 
struggling with the flood 

water! Swim to the water's 
edge!

Do not drive in flood waters, 
you may not see obstacles or 
potholes even if the water is 

very low!

Remember that water 
pressure will cause manhole 
covers and gratings to come 

off!

Flood Flowchart

(Faculty, Staff, Student)

If flood waters enter your 
area, move towards the upper 

floors of the building!

Never touch electrical 
equipment if you are wet or 

in water!

Rumelifeneri Campus

West Campus

YES

If there is a fire or a situation 
that threatens the structure, 

evacuate the building 
immediately!

Do not use elevators for 
evacuation

Do Not Panic!

Flood

When it is determined that 
there is a possibility of water 

entering the building, 
immediately call 0212 338 

1122 to cut the electricity and 
gas / unplug the electrical 

appliances!

Go to emergency assembly 
area or safe buildings as 
horizontal evacuation!

In the assembly area / secure 
building, act according to the 

directions of the Security
Team and other professional 

teams!

Do not return to the building 
or risk area until it is 

informed that it is safe!

Are you in the
open area?

If you are in the open area 
and in the direction of the 

flow of the water at the time 
of the flood, immediately go 

to a high place where the 
water cannot reach!

Do not try to walk or swim in 
flood waters!

(you cannot see obstacles, 
sharp objects, etc.)

If there is any malfunction in 
your vehicle, leave 

immediately and go to a high 
place, stay away from 

bridges and viaducts on fast 
flowing water.

Try to pull people and other 
living things in flood waters 
to the water edge with rope, 

stick, branch or floating 
materials to which you tie a 

rope! 
Never go into the water!

If you don't know how to 
swim, try to hold onto 

floating materials that drift 
with the flood waters!

If you have been injured during the flood, remember that you need to 
get a tetanus vaccine!


